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3,658,111 
1. 

HOUSING FORROLLER BLNDS 

The present invention relates to housing means for roller 
blinds and for sealing the masonry part receiving the roller 
blinds. 
Housings or boxes for roller blinds are, as a rule, made of 

wood and serve for covering the hollow chamber in the 
concrete lintel of the door or window after the roller blind has 
been installed therein. In this connection it is unavoidable that 
cold air, dust and drafts enter said chamber through the gap so 
that it is generally useless to insulate the front wall blanket or 
apron which points toward the outside. It is far more impor 
tant tightly and properly to insulate the inner box, which 
means the cover. This is of particular importance with large 
roller blinds because in such an instance the opening gap has 
to be wider because wide roller blinds often sag somewhat. 
When such roller blinds while being pulled up have each of 
their strips rub against the window frame, a disturbing loud 
noise results. Through the wider gap the draft air can still 
more easily enter into the above mentioned chamber. 

It is, therefore, an object of the present invention to provide 
a roller blind box of a material which adapts itself positively to 
the window, the ceiling and the masonry and has a better insu 
lating effect than thin wood. 

It is another object of this invention to provide a box for 
roller blinds, which is simple in construction and can easily be 
manufactured. 
These and other objects and advantages of the invention 

will appear more clearly from the following specification in 
connection with the accompanying drawings, in which: 

FIG. 1 is a cross-section through a chamber in a window lin 
tel with built-in roller blind box of the invention. 

FIG. 1a is a top plan view which illustrates the bottom por 
tion of a two-sectional roller blind box according to the inven 
tion. 

FIG. 2 is an end elevation of FIG. 1a. 
FIG. 3 shows a top view of the cover or top portion of a two 

sectional roller blind box. 
FIG. 4 is an end elevation of FIG. 3. 
FIG. 5 is a perspective view of an angle profile for connect 

ing the two roller box sections. 
FIG. 6 is a perspective view of, a modification illustrating a 

one-piece roller blind box. 
FIG. 7 represents a section taken along the line VII-VII of 

FIG. 6. 
FIG. 8 is a perspective illustration of a partial section of a 

plate of foam material which is provided with rectangular 
grooves and serves for producing a one-piece roller blind box. 

FIG. 9 is a section taken along the line IX-IX of FIG. 8 
with the right-hand part (with regard to FIG. 8) folded up 
wardly. 

FIG. 10 is a perspective illustration of a partial section of a 
plate of foam material in which the separating grooves include 
curved surface areas. 

FIG. 11 is a section taken along the line XI-XI of FIG. 10 
with the right-hand portion (with regard to FIG. 10) folded 
upwardly. 

FIG. 12 is a perspective illustration of a partial section of a 
foam material plate in which the separating grooves are of a 
V-shaped contour. 
FIG. 13 is a section through FIG. 12 taken along the line 

XIII-XIII thereof with the right-hand portion of FIG. 12 
folded upwardly. 

FIG. 14 is a perspective illustration of a roller blind box 
comprising more than two sections. 

FIG. 15 is a section taken along the line XV-XV of FIG. 
14. 
The above outlined objects have been realized in conformi 

ty with the present invention which latter is characterized in 
that the roller blind box forms a prefabricated building block 
set of two coherent one-piece foam sections of synthetic 
material of which sections the bottom with the lateral surfaces 
forms one part or one section whereas the front cover with the 
roof forms the other part or section of the roller blind box. 
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2 
Both sections are detachably interconnected by an angle rail 
or the like. As material for the parts making up the roller blind 
box are, in conformity with the present invention, preferred 
flexible medium to hard foams, for instance, on the basis of 
polystyrol, polyurethane, polyamide, phenol resin, 
polyethylene, etc. While attempts have been made to use 
polyvinylchloride plates for making roller blind boxes, such 
boxes become brittle after a relatively short time. In contrast 
thereto, the employed medium to hard foams are elastic to a 
great extent so that a better seal can be realized. Furthermore, 
the known synthetic foam material plates permit manufactur 
ing processes which lead to a considerable simplification in 
the construction of roller blind boxes of the type involved. Ac 
cording to the embodiment of the present invention, only two 
main sections are necessary which consist of correspondingly 
cut hard foam plates and which by means of an angle rail or 
the like are detachably connected to each other. In conformity 
with the invention, one section of the roller blind box is 
punched out of a foam material plate, is sawed or milled in 
such a way that the bottom part or bottom section at the two 
narrow sides has an extension in the direction of the length of 
the box which corresponds to the height of the box with a dou 
ble miter cut therebetween about which the two extensions 
can be folded upwardly and in this position form the lateral 
surfaces. Thus, there exist two possibilities of forming the said 
lateral surfaces of the roller blind box, depending on whether 
the construction is started from the bottom plate or from the 
cover plate. This assembly of the roller blind box in the 
manner of a carton by folding and upwardly bending the sec 
tions, while in view of the relative thickness of the foam 
material plates corresponding miter cuts are necessary, greatly 
simplifies the assembly of roller blind boxes and also reduces 
the manufacturing costs thereof. 
According to a further development of the present inven 

tion, the foam material parts are covered by a foil of polyvi 
nylchloride. It is advantageous in this connection that the foil 
covering the cover part protrudes at all four sides and that the 
protruding parts overlap those portions of the box which are 
adjacent thereto and form an angle of 90 therewith. In view of 
these steps, the butts of the roller blind sections are covered or 
overlapped so that the escape of draft air is effectively 
prevented. Furthermore, the total stiffness is increased by the 
applied polyvinylchloride foils so that a smooth outer surface 
will be obtained. 

Furthermore, in conformity with the present invention, at 
the abutting areas of the bottom and cover section the con 
necting angle rail which covers the butt joint portion has its 
one smooth leg connected to one box part, for instance, by ce 
menting, whereas the other leg is bent backwardly so as to 
form an arc which for purposes of forming a detachable clo 
sure snaps into a hook-shaped depression on the outside of the 
other box part. 

This arrangement eliminates the awkward loosening of 
screws as it has heretofore been necessary for the connection 
of the two box parts or box sections with the angle profile. 
This improved construction forms an automatic resilient clo 
sure which greatly facilitates the handling when opening the 
COWet. 

For purposes of connecting the foil of the cover plate to the 
ceiling of the room, this foil is in conformity with the present 
invention so extended that it protrudes to a great extent while 
said protrusions are angle off by 90'. 

Instead of the arrangement set forth in the preceding para 
graph, it is also possible to connect the cover plate at that sur 
face thereof which faces the ceiling with one leg of a profile of 
elastic material, such as rubber or synthetic material, whereas 
the other leg of said profile is connected to the ceiling of the 
room. In both instances, the elasticity of the foil connected to 
the ceiling permits an opening of the box portion cover by the 
foil so that the roller blind after loosening the angle rail con 
nection is easily accessible and can also easily be closed again. 
According to a further development of the invention, the 

roller blind box may also be so designed that all partial sur 
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faces of the box form a single-piece coherent part of synthetic 
foam material which for defining the partial surfaces is pro 
vided with grooves from which the foam material has been 
removed with the exception of a cover layer over which the in 
dividual surface parts are folded toward each other so as to 
form a box. 
Due to the fact that the roller blind box is formed by folding 

over the individual partial surfaces separated from each other 
by grooves and pertaining to a single synthetic form body, 
considerable advantages are obtained with regard to the 
manufacturing process which are reflected in a further 
decrease in the manufacturing costs for the roller blind box. 
The grooves provided between the individual partial sur 

faces may, according to a further development of the inven 
tion, have plane and/or curved surfaces which in folded condi 
tion contact each other either completely or partially. Accord 
ing to a first possible embodiment, the groove surfaces may be 
plane and extend at an angle or parallel to each other. The 
groove surfaces may define an angle with each other of the 
magnitude of 90 and greater. In this way it will be assured that 
the individual partial surfaces can be folded over unimpededly 
so as to define a right angle with each other. 
When the plane groove surfaces are parallel to each other, 

the parallel distance of two oppositely located plane groove 
surfaces equals at least the thickness of the foam material 
plate. This affords the possibility of supporting the folded part 
against that part of the box which is transverse thereto. 
The oppositely located groove surfaces may, if desired, also 

be curved to such an extent that they end in a common line of 
intersection and that the outer arc of one groove surface cor 
responds to the inner arc of the other surface. In view of the 
complete or partial surface contact of the individual groove 
surfaces in folded condition of the partial surfaces of the sin 
gle-piece foam material body, the sealing effect of the roller 
blind box against cold air and dust is greatly increased. 
The two-sectional as well as the one-piece roller blind boxes 

according to the invention have proved highly satisfactory and 
no difficulties are encountered as to their manufacture. How 
ever, in order to develop a complete manufacturing and instal 
lation program, all partial surfaces of the box may be 
produced as individual parts separate from each other and 
may be made in the form of a synthetic foam body, and the 
areas where the individual partial surface are connected to 
each other may be made plane or curved so that in the said 
connecting area a right angled or an acute or obtuse angled 
adaptation and connection of the surfaces will be possible. 
The assembly of the roller blind box from a plurality of in 

dividual parts has great advantages with regard to the packing 
process because small surface parts are obtained. This applies 
in particular when relatively large roller blind boxes are in 
volved. 

Referring now to the drawings in detail and FIGS. 1 to 5 
thereof in particular, these figures show the individual parts of 
a two-sectional roller blind box according to the present in 
vention. As will be seen from the drawings, the bottom section 
1 has a connecting strip 2 and is furthermore provided with ex 
tensions 3 for forming the side or lateral surfaces, said exten 
sions 3 being adapted to be folded about the double miter cuts 
4. A foil 7 covers the foam material. As will be seen from FIG. 
3, the foil 7 protrudes at both sides from the cover 5 at 6. Also 
the bottom 1 is covered with a foil 7. The botton 1 and the 
cover 5 are interconnected by an angle rail 8 (FIG. 5) while 
screws are used as connecting means. The angle rail 8 extends 
over the cover foil 7 of both parts 1 and 5 and thus assures an 
absolutely tight seal. The connection of the cover 5 to the 
room ceiling may, however, also be effected to a wooden latch 
or strip previously attached to this area. There also exists the 
possibility of connecting the cover 5 to the room ceiling by 
connecting a rubber or soft polyvinylchloride profile on one 
hand to the room ceiling and on the other hand to the upper 
end of the cover 5. With this type of connection, the cover 5 
can due to the elasticity of the profile material be easily folded 
or lifted. 
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4 
According to the embodiment shown in F.G. 6, the roller 

blind box consists of a single plate of foam material. The bot 
tom9, the side surfaces 10 and the cover 11 are separated 
from each other by grooves 12. The embodiment illustrated in 
FIG. 6 has plane groove surfaces 13 which form an angle with 
each other. The individual surface parts are folded at the line 
of intersection 14 and thus form the box. The cover 11 of the 
roller blind box is formed by cuts made in the central portion 
of the plate, said cuts being effected along the lines 15, 16, 17 
and 18 so that the cover 11 can be folded downwardly about 
the line 19 because along this line the foam material plate is 
cut through only up to the outer cover foil. 

Instead of the plane groove surfaces 13 located at an angle 
with regard to each other, it is also possible, as indicated in 
FIGS. 8 and 9, to provide groove surfaces 20 which are paral 
lel to each other. With this embodiment it is merely necessary 
that the parallel distance equals at least the thickness of the 
plate of foam material so that, as will be evident from FIG.9, 
in folded condition a rectangular arrangement of the surface 
portions and even a support of the folded portion 21 on the 
transverse part 22 will be possible. This applies in particular to 
the side surfaces 10 which may rest against the bottom 9 of the 
roller blind box. 

FIG. 10 illustrates that the separating grooves 12 may also 
have curved surfaces 23. FIG. 11 shows the arrangement of 
FIG. 10 in folded condition. FIG. 12 illustrates once more the 
angle shaped grooves disclosed in FIG. 6 but in unfolded con 
dition with plane grooved surfaces defining an angle with each 
other. FIG. 13 shows the structure of FIG. 12 in folded condi 
tion. 
The particular advantage of roller blind boxes as described 

above consists in that all partial surfaces form a part of a single 
foam material body, and the individual partial surfaces are 
separated from each other merely by grooves of a special 
shape and groove contour in such a way that a folding is possi 
ble in such a way that, as mentioned above, the individual 
groove surfaces contact each other either completely or par 
tially. The employment of a plate of foam material as the basic 
structural element in combination with a folding of the partial 
surfaces to form a box-shaped structure similar to a folding 
carton will afford an assurance that the box will be dust-free 
and draft air-tight while on the other hand the manufacturing 
costs for such roller blind boxes are rather low. 

Referring now to FIGS. 14 and 15, the roller blind box illus 
trated therein is composed of the individual members 24, 25, 
26 and 27 which are connected to each other by gluing, ce 
menting, screws or brackets or the like so as to form a box 
unit. The end face 24 of the box is within the area of the open 
ing 28 cut open along the lines 29, 30 and 31 and thereby per 
mits the folding out of the surface 32 forming the cover. For 
purposes of connecting the cover, the inner side is provided 
with a member 33 of wood or synthetic material. 

It is, of course, to be understood that the present invention 
is, by no means, limited to the particular showing in the 
drawings but also comprises any modifications within the 
scope of the appended claims. 
What I claim is: 
1. In a building construction, in which a window opening is 

formed in a masonry wall with a window in said opening hav 
ing a frame with a top member adjacent the top of said open 
ing, and a recess in the inner side of said masonry wall above 
said top member and closed on its outer side, and in which a 
roller blind is mounted in said recess with the roller blind 
movable downwardly outside of said window, a roller blind 
housing closing and sealing said recess on the inner side of said 
wall comprising a structure having side and top walls in en 
gagement with said masonry wall at the sides and top of said 
recess and a bottom wall extending into said recess to engage 
said top member of said frame, and a front wall closing the 
area between said top, bottom and side walls, each wall being 
formed with an inner surface layer of foam insulating material 
and with an outer surface of plastic foil, said inner surface 
layers of foam material having abutting edges to form a tight, 
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sealed joint to seal said recess by said housing, the front wall of 
said housing having an opening closed by a hinged panel hav 
ing a foam inner surface layer. 

2. In a building construction as claimed in claim 1, in which 
the plastic foil extends across the joints to form an air-tight 
seal. 

3. In a building construction as claimed in claim 1, in which 
the said walls are made in a plurality of parts, and the joints 
between the parts are formed by extending the foil across the 
joint to seal the joint. 

4. In a building construction as claimed in claim 1, in which 
said housing comprises two sections, the first section having 
interconnected bottom and side walls and the second section 
having a front wall with the hinged panel and the top wall. 

5. In a building construction as claimed in claim 1, in which 
said foam insulating material is a flexible material selected 
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6 
from the group consisting of polystyrol, polyurethane, polya 
mide, phenobresin and polyethylene foams. 

6. In a building construction as claimed in claim 1, in which 
said housing is made in a plurality of sections forming said 
walls, and the joints between the sections include rail means 
overlapping the joints and detachably connected to at least 
one section. 

7. In a building construction as claimed in claim A, in which 
at least two of said walls are connected together by a single 
piece of foam material having an outer foil surface, said foam 
material of the inner surface layer being grooved along said 
joint so that the piece of material may be hinged by said foil 
and folded at right angles with the edges of said foam layer 
abutting. 

k is s : 


