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57 ABSTRACT 

An improved drawer construction is provided which 
includes a usual box section composed, for example, 
of wood; and which includes a plastic front member 
for the drawer which may simulate wood, and which 
extends across the open front of the box. The plastic 
front member is configured to have integral ribs 
formed in its rear surface which define slots for receiv 
ing the front edge of the box, and which also consti 
tute supports for the front edge of the bottom of the 
box. The plastic front member may be composed of an 
appropriate plastic material, such as polyvinylchloride, 
for example, so that it may be stapled, or otherwise 
appropriately fastened to the front edge of the box. 

5 Claims, 4 Drawing Figures 
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3,767,281 
1. 

DRAWER CONSTRUCTION INCLUDING PLASTC 
DRAWER FRONT 

BACKGROUND OF THE INVENTION 
Drawers having plastic front panels are known. How 

ever, the prior art drawer of this type usually includes 
a complete box, with a plastic panel, or the like, being 
inserted into the existing front member of the box. 
Such a construction is uneconomical, and it entails an 
excessive number of components. 

In the construction of the present invention, a plastic 
member is shaped to constitute in and of itself the front 
of the drawer, and it extends across the front of the 
drawer box to form an enclosure for the box. The plas 
tic drawer front of the invention is shaped to receive 
the front edge of the box so that a complete and rigid 
assembly may be provided. The plastic drawer front 
may be composed of any appropriate plastic material, 
such as polyvinylchloride, to enable it to be stapled, or 
otherwise fastened to the box. The plastic drawer front 
itself may be formed to simulate wood, or it may have 
any desired color or pleasing design formed in it. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

FIG. 1 is a perspective representation showing a typi 
cal drawer box, and showing a plastic drawer front, 
constructed in accordance with the invention, and in a 
detached position with respect to the box; 
FIG. 2 is a section taken essentially alone the line 

2-2, to show the construction of the plastic drawer 
front; 

FIG. 3 is a bottom view showing the plastic drawer 
front and box in an assembled condition; and 
FIG. 4 is a front view showing a plastic drawer front 

constructed in accordance with the invention and, in 
the illustration, simulating wood. 
DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF THE ILLUSTRATED 

EMBODIMENT 

The illustrated drawer assembly includes, for exam 
ple, a box designated 10 and which includes a pair of 
side walls 12 and 14 and a back or rear wall 16. The 
box 10 also includes a bottom 18. The side walls 12 and 
14, the rear wall 16, and the bottom 18 may all be com 
posed of an appropriate material, such as wood. 
The side walls 12 and 14, the rear wall 16, and the 

bottom 18 are mutually attached to one another to 
form the box 10. The resulting box has an open front, 
as shown in FIG. 1, and the front is enclosed by a plas 
tic drawer front 20, which is constructed to incorporate 
the concepts of the invention. The drawer front 20 is 
composed of a molded plastic, such as polyvinylchlo 
ride (PVC), and it is molded to have a plurality of inte 
gral ribs on its rear surface, as shown. The ribs define 
vertical side slots at each end of the drawer front 20 
and which receive the front edges of the side walls 12 
and 14. The ribs also define a horizontal slot which ex 
tends the length of the plastic member 20, and which 
receives the front edge of the bottom 18. Horizontal 
ribs 22 extending under the aforesaid slots, serve as a 
support for the front edge of the bottom 18. 
As shown in FIG. 1, the rear surface of the plastic 

drawer front 20 is molded to define a plurality of verti 
cal ribs 24 which extend in spaced and parallel relation 
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ship. The ribs 24 at each end of the member 20 define, 
in conjunction with a first series of horizontal ribs des 
ignated 26, and a second series of horizontal ribs desig 
nated 28, a pair of vertical slots for respectively receiv 
ing the front edges of the side walls 12 and 14. Also 
moded into the rear wall of the plastic member 20, is 
a further horizontal rib 27 which receives the fasteners 
of an appropriate handle 29, shown in FIGS. 3 and 4. 
The ribs 22 and 26 may be pointed, as shown, to cut 
into the wood sides and bottom of the drawer 10, so as 
to hold the plastic member and the drawer rigidly to 
gether. 
The plastic drawer front 20 is fitted onto the front 

edge of the box 10, as best shown in FIGS. 2 and 3, with 
the front edges of the side walls 12 and 14 extending 
into the aforesaid vertical slots, and with the front edge 
of the bottom 18 extending into the aforesaid horizon 
tal slot, to be supported by the ribs 22. The drawer 
front 20 may be attached to the box 10, by means, for 
example, of staples 30, or it may be frictionally or adhe 
sively attached to the box, or other appropriate fasten 
ing means may be used. The drawer front is preferably 
grained, as shown in FIG. 4 to simulate wood. 
The invention provides, therefore, a simple and eco 

nomical construction for a drawer assembly, by which 
a plastic drawer front is attached to the box of the 
drawer and constitutes an enclosure for the front end 
of the box. 
Although a particular embodiment of the invention 

has been shown and described, modifications may be 
made, and it is intended in the claims to cover the mod 
ifications which fall within the spirit and scope of the 
invention. 

I claim: 
1. In a drawer assembly which includes a rectangular 

box section having a pair of spaced and parallel side 
walls, a back wall extending between said side walls at 
one end thereof, and a bottom, all mutually attached to 
one another, and having an open front; a flat elongated 
rectangular front member attached to the front edge of 
said box section and extending across said open front 
thereof, said front member being composed of molded 
plastic material having a plurality of integral ribs on the 
rear surface thereof defining a pair of vertical slots at 
the respective ends of said front member for receiving 
the front edges of said side walls, and said integral ribs 
also defining a horizontal slot extending the length of 
said front member for receiving the front edge of the 
bottom of said box section. 

2. The drawer assembly defined in claim 1, in which 
the front surface of said plastic front member simulates 
wood. 

3. The drawer assembly defined in claim 1, in which 
said plastic front member is formed of polyvinylchlo 
ride, 

4. The drawer assembly defined in claim 1, and which 
includes staple fastening means attaching said plastic 
front member to said box section. 

5. The drawer section defined in claim 1, in which 
said integral ribs formed on the rear surface of said 
plastic front member also constitute a support for the 
front edge of the bottom of said box section. 
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